
LEGAL NOTICE NO.  170

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT,  CHAP.  58:01 

ORDER

MADE BY THE MINISTER OF FINANCE UNDER SECTION 20  OF THE

LAND ACQUISITION ACT

THE  LAND  ACQUISITION  (VARIATION  OF  RATE  OF  INTEREST
ON  COMPENSATION)  ORDER,  2016

1. This Order may be cited as the Land Acquisition (Variation of
Rate of Interest on Compensation) Order, 2016.

2. Section 20 of the Land Acquisition Act is amended–

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “nine per cent” and
substituting the words “five per cent”; and

(b) in subsection (3), by deleting the words “nine per cent” and
substituting the words “five per cent”.

Dated this 11th day of October, 2016.

C.  IMBERT
Minister of Finance

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 55, No. 130–10th November, 2016 787

Citation

Section 20
amended
Chap. 58:01

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER,  CARONI

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2016


