Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 53, No. 120—16th September, 2014 697

LeEcAL Notice No. 275
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO
THE EXCISE (GENERAL PROVISIONS) AcT, CHAP. 78:50

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE MINISTER UNDER SECTION 76 OF THE EXCISE (GENERAL
PROVISIONS) AcCT

THE EXCISE (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2014

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Excise (Fees) citation
(Amendment) Regulations, 2014.

2. In these Regulations, “the Regulations” means the Excise (Fees) Interpretation

Regulations. Chap. 78:50
3. Regulation 6 of the Regulations is amended in the Table— Regulation 6
amended

(a) in paragraph (a)—

(1) in subparagraph (i), by deleting the words “$67.84”
and substituting the words “$75.44”; and

(ii) in subparagraph (ii), by deleting the words “$67.84”
and “$90.44” and substituting the words “$75.44” and
“$100.58”, respectively; and

(b) in paragraph (b)}—

(i) in subparagraph (i), by deleting the words “$57.55”
and substituting the words “$64.20”; and

(ii) in subparagraph (ii), by deleting the words “$57.55”
and “$76.74” and substituting the words “$64.20” and
“$85.60”, respectively.

4. Regulation 7 of the Regulations is revoked and the following Regulation 7

regulation is substituted: revoked and
substituted

“Overtime 7. (1) The overtime fees in respect of the
Fees services of officers out of normal office hours are

payable to the Comptroller at the rates and for the
Schedule years set out in the Schedule.

(2) The fees set out in the Schedule in
respect of—
(a) the year 2008, are deemed to have

come into effect on 1st January,
2008;



698

Excise (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations, 2014

Schedule

substituted

(b) the year 2009, are deemed to have
come into effect on 1st January,

2009;

(c) the year 2010, are deemed to have
come into effect on 1st January,
2010; and

(d) the year 2011, are deemed to have
come into effect on 1st January,

2011.

(3) Notwithstanding subregulation (1), any
person who utilized any of the services mentioned
in the Schedule shall be exempt from the payment
of any sums of monies representing the difference
between the rates which were payable, in respect
of those services, before 1st January, 2008 and the
rates set out in the Schedule.”.

5. The Schedule to the Regulations is repealed and the following
repealed and Sehedule is substituted:

“SCHEDULE

PART A

(Regulation 7)

Receiving or delivering spirits from warehouse or any other services—each officer,
other than a guard—

2008

2009

2010

2011

On ordinary
weekdays

On Saturdays,
Sundays

and public
holidays

$70.41 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$70.41 for each
hour or part
thereof for
the first eight

hours and
thereafter
$93.87 for

each hour or
part thereof.

$71.12 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$71.12 for each
hour or part
thereof for the
first eight
hours and
thereafter
$94.82  for
each hour or
part thereof.

$72.53 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$72.53 for each
hour or part
thereof for
the first eight
hours and
thereafter
$96.71 for
each hour or
part thereof.

$75.44 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$75.44 for each
hour or part
thereof for the
first  eight
hours and
thereafter
$100.58 for
each hour or
part thereof.




Excise (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations, 2014

699

PART B

Receiving or delivering spirits from warehouse or any other services—each guard—

2008

2009

2010

2011

On ordinary
weekdays

On Saturdays,

$59.93 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$59.93 for each

$60.52 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$60.52 for each

$61.73 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$61.73 for each

$64.20 for each
hour or part
thereof.

$64.20 for each

Sundays hour or part| hour or part| hour or part hour or part
and public thereof for| thereoffor the| thereof for thereof for the
holidays the first eight | first eight| the first eight first  eight
hours and| hours and| hours and hours and
thereafter| thereafter| thereafter thereafter
$79.90 for| $80.70 for $82.30 for $85.60 for each
each hour or| each hour or each hour or hour or part
part thereof. part thereof. part thereof. thereof.”.
Dated this 15th day of September, 2014.
L. HOWAI

Minister of Finance and the Economy

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI
RepUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2014



